

**Bid responses received for :  
11-156 Scanners and Software**

	<b>Business Services</b>	<b>Microtek</b>	<b>Priton Group</b>
<b>SCANNERS</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
Canon Image Formula P150M with 1 Year Warranty	\$ 289.98	\$ 313.00	No Bid
Canon Image Formula DR-7550C with 1 Year Warranty	\$ 4,809.98	\$ 6,619.00	No Bid
Canon Image Formula DC-X10C with 1 Year Warranty	\$ 16,999.98	\$ 18,189.00	No Bid
Xerox Documate 152 with 1 Year Warranty	\$ 356.98	\$ 559.00	No Bid
Fujitsu Fi-6130 with 1 Year Warranty			\$ 862.00
Fujitsu Fi-6800 with 1 Year Warranty	\$ 16,669.98	\$ 19,099.00	\$ 16,867.00
<b>SOFTWARE</b>			
Nuance PaperPort Professional v. 12	\$ 164.98	No Bid	No Bid
Nuance PaperPort Professional v. 12 Maintenance	\$ 29.98	No Bid	No Bid
Nuance OmniPage 18 Standard	\$ 148.98	No Bid	No Bid
Nuance OmniPage 18 Standard Maintenance	\$ 99.98	No Bid	No Bid
Nuance OmniPage 18 Professional	\$ 429.98	No Bid	No Bid
Nuance OmniPage 18 Professional Maintenance	\$ 299.98	No Bid	No Bid
Nuance OmniPage 18 Enterprise	Not available	No Bid	No Bid
Nuance OmniPage 18 Enterprise Maintenance	Not available	No Bid	No Bid

*This is a list of the bid responses received, and is provided for informational purposes only. This is not a Notice of Bid Award*