

**11-148 Network Video Equipment
Bid response report**

Item #	Description	Part #	Supplier				
			Royal Systems	Halifax Security	OM Office Supply	B & H Video	Tech Electronics
			Price	Price	Price	Price	Price
1.	Axis M1104 Fixed Camera	0339-001	\$ 374.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 334.00	\$ 385.00	\$ 370.95
2.	Axis M1114 Fixed Camera	0341-001	\$ 457.00	\$ 396.00	\$ 406.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 453.56
3.	AXIS P1343-E Fixed Camera with Enclosure	0349-001	\$ 832.00	\$ 721.00	\$ 738.00	\$ 860.00	\$ 838.46
4.	AXIS P1344-E Fixed Camera with Enclosure	0350-001	\$ 916.00	\$ 793.00	\$ 812.00	\$ 949.00	\$ 907.95
5.	Fujinon Varifocal Megapixel Lens 2.2-6 mm	5502-751	\$ 124.00	\$ 71.00	\$ 111.00	No bid	\$ 125.06
6.	Pentax Varifocal Lens 5-50 mm	5500-291	\$ 141.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 126.00	\$ 144.00	\$ 141.84
7.	Pentax Varifocal Lens 5-50 mm 10 Pack	5500-941	\$ 1,332.00	\$ 540.00	\$ 1,260.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 1,342.04
8.	Theia Fixedfocal Megapixel Lens 1.7 mm	5502-451	\$ 206.00	\$ 164.00	\$ 184.00	\$ 230.00	\$ 208.15
9.	Axis 209FD Fixed Dome Camera	0281-004	\$ 433.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 333.00	\$ 385.00	\$ 370.95
10.	Axis M3204-V Fixed Dome Camera Vandal-resistant	0346-001	\$ 449.00	\$ 389.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 465.00	\$ 445.30
11.	Axis 216FD-V Fixed Dome Camera Vandal-resistant	0268-004	\$ 589.00	\$ 483.00	\$ 500.00	No entry	\$ 561.68
12.	Axis 216MFD-V Fixed Dome Camera Vandal-resistant	0279-004	\$ 670.00	\$ 555.00	\$ 570.00	No entry	\$ 645.42
13.	Axis P3344-V Fixed Dome Camera Vandal-resistant 6mm	0327-001	\$ 738.00	\$ 678.00	\$ 695.00	\$ 815.00	\$ 788.10
14.	Axis P3344-VE Fixed Dome Camera Vandal-resistant 6mm	0325-001	\$ 863.00	\$ 793.00	\$ 815.00	\$ 949.00	\$ 922.39
15.	Axis P3346-V Fixed Dome Camera Vandal-resistant	0370-001	\$ 907.00	\$ 786.00	\$ 810.00	\$ 1,025.00	\$ 914.00
16.	Axis P3346-VE Fixed Dome Camera Vandal-resistant	0371-001	\$ 1,040.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 920.00	\$ 1,165.00	\$ 1,048.29
17.	AXIS T92A10 Camera Housing	5015-101	\$ 249.00	\$ 218.00	\$ 221.00	\$ 258.00	\$ 250.95
18.	AXIS Indoor Fixed Wall Housing	24886	\$ 249.00	\$ 218.00	\$ 221.00	\$ 258.00	\$ 250.95
19.	AXIS Indoor Fixed Corner Housing	24887	\$ 249.00	\$ 219.00	\$ 221.00	\$ 258.00	\$ 250.95
20.	AXIS Indoor Fixed Ceiling Housing	24888	\$ 166.00	\$ 148.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 167.02
21.	AXIS 241Q Video Server Blade	0209-011	\$ 628.00	\$ 505.00	\$ 520.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 586.67
22.	AXIS 243Q Video Server Blade	0261-001	\$ 832.00	\$ 721.00	\$ 740.00	\$ 860.00	\$ 838.46
23.	AXIS Q7406 Video Server Blade	0289-001	\$ 1,249.00	\$ 1,087.00	\$ 1,110.00	\$ 1,294.00	\$ 1,258.10
24.	Axis 291 1U Video Server Rack	0267-004	\$ 332.00	\$ 289.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 344.00	\$ 334.88
25.	AXIS T91A67 Pole Bracket	5017-671	\$ 78.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 83.09
26.	AXIS Steel Straps for pole bracket	5700-981	\$ 11.75	\$ 12.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 11.75
27.	AXIS Mounting Tool for pole bracket straps	21776	\$ 121.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 121.70
28.	AXIS T91A61 Wall Bracket	5017-611	\$ 78.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 83.09
29.	AXIS P33 Series Pendant Kit	5502-351	\$ 32.50	\$ 29.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 32.73
30.	AXIS P3343-VE/P3344-VE/P3346-VE Series Pendant Kit	5502-321	\$ 41.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 44.00	\$ 41.13
			\$ 14,387.25	\$ 11,712.00	\$ 12,834.00	\$ 13,670.00	\$ 14,395.61
31.	ipConfigure 8 camera base license with 1st year support.	IPC-ESM-BAS	No bid	\$ 1,660.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 1,706.09
32.	ipConfigure single camera add on with 1st year support	IPC-ESM-ADD	No bid	\$ 209.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 213.26
33.	ipConfigure single camera 1 year support	IPC-SAY-1YR	No bid	\$ 52.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 53.31
			\$ 14,387.25	\$ 13,633.00	\$ 12,834.00	\$ 13,670.00	\$ 16,368.27