

11-134 Pebblebrook Drainage Improvement

Vendor	Amount Bid		
	Alternate 1	Alternate 2	Alternate 3
MICK MEHLER & SONS	\$ 159,079.00	\$ 162,413.00	No bid
SOUTHERN DITCHING	\$ 178,943.64	\$ 177,031.88	\$ 186,639.86
BI STATE UTILITIES	\$ 308,528.95	\$ 300,648.95	\$ 273,797.75
JH BERRA CONSTRUCTION	\$ 144,149.90	\$ 144,318.80	No bid
WEHMEYER FARMS	\$ 179,387.00	\$ 185,801.00	No bid
XL CONTRACTING	\$ 153,236.10	\$ 165,510.10	No bid
SAK CONSTRUCTION	No bid	No bid	\$ 192,321.86
JM MARSCHUETZ	\$ 259,788.80	No bid	No bid