

11-120 Network Equipment		ISG	AMDEX	World Wide	CDW	Ace	Office	CDS Office
		Technology		Technology	Government	Computers	Essentials	Tech
<b>HP Networking</b>								
<b>Item #</b>	<b>HP E4500G Class-Model / Part Number</b>							
		<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
1.	HP E4500-24G-PoE Switch (JE061A)	Discontinued	\$ 1,710.00	\$ 2,823.58	\$ 3,221.12	\$ 2,790.38	\$ 2,820.00	\$ 2,320.00
2.	HP E4500-48G-PoE Switch(JE063A)	\$ 4,147.00	\$ 3,683.00	\$ 4,950.83	\$ 5,611.68	\$ 4,889.16	\$ 4,940.00	\$ 4,060.00
<b>HP E4510G Class-Model / Part Number</b>								
		<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
3.	HP E4510-24G Switch(JF847A)	Discontinued	\$ 2,105.00	\$ 2,118.25	\$ 2,400.27	\$ 2,089.14	\$ 2,115.00	\$ 1,754.00
4.	HP E4510-48G Switch(JF848A)	Discontinued	\$ 2,395.00	\$ 3,530.11	\$ 4,013.75	\$ 3,500.36	\$ 3,525.00	Discontinued
<b>HP E4800G Class</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
5.	HP E4800-24G Switch(JD007A)	\$ 2,368.00	\$ 2,579.00	\$ 2,365.98	\$ 3,112.19	\$ 2,790.38	\$ 2,715.00	\$ 2,310.00
6.	HP E4800-24G-PoE Switch(JD008A)	\$ 2,839.00	\$ 2,837.00	\$ 2,878.35	\$ 3,710.31	\$ 3,345.82	\$ 3,275.00	\$ 2,752.00
7.	HP E4800-48G Switch(JD010A)	\$ 4,147.00	\$ 4,158.00	\$ 4,196.16	\$ 5,283.92	\$ 4,887.16	\$ 4,835.00	\$ 4,058.00
8.	HP E4800-48G-PoE Switch(JD011A)	\$ 5,346.00	\$ 5,048.00	\$ 5,163.95	\$ 6,769.03	\$ 5,935.56	\$ 5,895.00	\$ 4,953.00
9.	HP E4800-24G-SFP Switch(JD009A)	\$ 3,758.00	\$ 3,316.00	\$ 3,653.30	\$ 4,787.91	\$ 4,185.93	\$ 4,125.00	\$ 3,453.00
<b>HP E5500G Class</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
10.	HP E5500-24G Switch(JE088A)	\$ 2,663.00	\$ 2,516.00	\$ 3,174.86	\$ 3,582.91	\$ 3,151.65	\$ 3,175.00	\$ 2,611.00
11.	HP E5500-24G-PoE Switch(JE092A)	\$ 3,317.00	\$ 3,158.00	\$ 3,959.17	\$ 4,692.61	\$ 3,908.21	\$ 3,950.00	\$ 3,271.00
12.	HP E5500-48G Switch(JE090A)	\$ 4,736.00	\$ 4,521.00	\$ 5,654.24	\$ 6,515.18	\$ 5,606.58	\$ 5,645.00	\$ 4,647.00
13.	HP E5500-48G-PoE Switch(JE094A)	\$ 5,920.00	\$ 7,105.00	\$ 7,667.98	\$ 8,232.73	\$ 6,976.79	\$ 7,055.00	\$ 5,838.00
14.	HP E5500-24G-SFP Switch(JE096A)	\$ 4,147.00	\$ 3,789.00	\$ 4,950.89	\$ 5,613.62	\$ 4,887.16	\$ 4,940.00	\$ 4,110.00
<b>HP A5800 Class-Model / Part Number</b>								
		<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
15.	HP A5810-48G Switch(JF242A)	\$ 5,384.00	\$ 6,486.00	\$ 6,427.92	\$ 7,288.38	\$ 6,373.74	\$ 6,420.00	\$ 6,438.00
16.	HP A5820-14XG-SFP+ 2-Slot Switch(JC106A)	No Bid	\$ 13,251.00	\$ 13,314.39	\$ 14,096.32	\$ 12,755.16	N/A	\$ 13,114.00
17.	HP A5820-24XG-SFP+ Switch(JC102A)	Discontinued	\$ 11,925.00	\$ 11,982.15	\$ 12,920.49	\$ 11,478.88	N/A	\$ 11,801.00
<b>HP A-Series Wireless-Model / Part Number</b>								
		<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
18.	HP A-WX5002 Access Controller(JD447B)	Discontinued	\$ 6,138.00	\$ 6,296.47	\$ 7,209.60	\$ 6,004.99	N/A	\$ 4,998.00
19.	HP A-WX5004 Access Controller(JD448B)	\$ 5,926.00	\$ 7,139.00	\$ 7,075.01	\$ 8,022.66	\$ 6,983.95	\$ 7,060.00	\$ 5,815.00
20.	HP A-WX5000 32 Access Point License Upgrade(JD463A)	\$ 1,445.00	\$ 1,745.00	\$ 1,738.11	\$ 1,753.24	\$ 1,714.23	\$ 1,735.00	\$ 1,427.00
21.	HP A-WA2610E-AGN Access Point (JD452A)	\$ 377.00	\$ 453.00	\$ 449.84	\$ 521.28	\$ 443.66	\$ 462.00	\$ 364.00
22.	HP A-WA2620-AGN Access Point(JD472A)	\$ 483.00	\$ 581.00	\$ 576.56	\$ 673.00	\$ 568.63	\$ 575.00	\$ 466.00
23.	HP A-WA2620E-AGN Access Point(JD453A)	\$ 536.00	\$ 644.00	\$ 639.91	\$ 744.98	\$ 631.11	\$ 640.00	\$ 515.00

11-120 Network Equipment		ISG	AMDEX	World Wide	CDW	Ace	Office	CDS Office
		Technology		Technology	Government	Computers	Essentials	Tech
<b>HP Modules / Accessories</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
24.	HP 2-Port 10 GbE SFP+ A5500/E4800/E4500 Module(JD368B)	\$ 1,343.00	\$ 1,611.00	\$ 1,601.13	\$ 1,706.84	\$ 1,582.31	\$ 1,599.00	\$ 1,314.00
25.	HP X130 SFP+ LC SR Transceiver(JD092B)	\$ 1,019.00	\$ 1,222.00	\$ 1,214.72	\$ 1,339.21	\$ 1,200.44	\$ 1,215.00	\$ 995.00
26.	HP X240 SFP+ 0.65m Direct Attach Cable(JD095B)	\$ 100.00	\$ 119.00	\$ 118.98	\$ 151.71	\$ 117.34	\$ 120.00	\$ 98.00
27.	HP X240 SFP+ 1.2m Direct Attach Cable(JD096B)	\$ 112.00	\$ 158.00	\$ 113.05	\$ 171.16	\$ 131.23	\$ 135.00	\$ 110.00
28.	HP X240 SFP+ 3m Direct Attach Cable(JD097B)	\$ 144.00	\$ 168.00	\$ 168.25	\$ 211.04	\$ 165.94	\$ 169.00	\$ 140.00
<b>SonicWALL Appliances / Licensing</b>								
<b>SonicWALL Email Security Appliance (ESA) 3300</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
29.	SonicWALL Email Security ESA 3300 Appliance(01-SSC-6607)	\$ 1,229.00	\$ 1,227.00	\$ 1,272.15	\$ 1,429.66	\$ 1,369.38	\$ 1,350.00	No Bid
30	SonicWALL Email Security ESA 3300 Secure Upgrade Plus Appliance (01-SSC-6837)	\$ 737.00	\$ 737.00	\$ 763.29	\$ 876.36	\$ 821.63	\$ 869.00	No Bid
<b>SonicWALL Email Security Appliance (ESA) 4300</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
3.	SonicWALL Email Security ESA 4300 Appliance(01-SSC-6608)	\$ 4,787.00	\$ 4,785.00	\$ 4,957.48	No Bid	\$ 5,336.39	\$ 5,255.00	No Bid
4.	SonicWALL Email Security ESA 4300 Secure Upgrade Plus Appliance (01-SSC-6838)	\$ 2,872.00	\$ 4,418.00	\$ 2,974.49	\$ 3,394.24	\$ 3,201.84	\$ 3,375.00	No Bid
<b>SonicWALL Email Security Appliance (ESA) 8300</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
5.	SonicWALL Email Security ESA 8300 Appliance(01-SSC-6609)	\$ 12,313.00	\$ 12,311.00	\$ 12,753.40	\$ 17,545.13	\$ 13,728.14	\$ 13,525.00	No Bid
6.	SonicWALL Email Security ESA 8300 Secure Upgrade Plus Appliance (01-SSC-6839)	\$ 7,388.00	\$ 7,388.00	\$ 7,652.04	\$ 8,580.91	\$ 8,236.89	\$ 8,690.00	No Bid
<b>SonicWALL Email Security Licensing</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
7.	SonicWALL Email Protection and 8x5 Support (2000 Users – 1 Year) (01-SSC-6663)	\$ 3,764.00	\$ 3,763.00	\$ 3,897.95	\$ 4,349.24	\$ 4,195.88	\$ 4,095.00	No Bid
8.	SonicWALL Email Protection and 8x5 Support (2000 Users – 2 Years) (01-SSC-6793)	\$ 6,398.00	\$ 6,396.00	\$ 6,626.52	\$ 8,222.13	\$ 7,194.85	\$ 6,960.00	No Bid

11-120 Network Equipment		ISG	AMDEX	World Wide	CDW	Ace	Office	CDS Office
		Technology		Technology	Government	Computers	Essentials	Tech
9.	SonicWALL Email Protection and 8x5 Support (2000 Users – 3 Years) (01-SSC-7483)	\$ 9,032.00	\$ 9,032.00	\$ 9,355.08	\$ 10,437.22	\$ 10,070.10	\$ 9,825.00	No Bid
10.	SonicWALL Email Protection and 24x7 Support (2000 Users – 1 Year) (01-SSC-6673)	\$ 4,311.00	\$ 4,311.00	\$ 4,464.93	\$ 4,981.07	\$ 4,806.19	\$ 4,690.00	No Bid
11.	SonicWALL Email Protection and 24x7 Support (2000 Users – 2 Years) (01-SSC-7493)	\$ 7,328.00	\$ 7,327.00	\$ 7,590.38	\$ 8,468.21	\$ 8,170.52	\$ 7,975.00	No Bid
12.	SonicWALL Email Protection and 24x7 Support (2000 Users – 3 Years) (01-SSC-7503)	\$ 10,346.00	\$ 10,345.00	\$ 10,715.83	\$ 13,559.99	\$ 11,534.85	\$ 11,255.00	No Bid
<b>SonicWALL Network Security Appliance (NSA) E5500</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
13.	SonicWALL Network Security E5500 Appliance(01-SSC-7008)	\$ 6,839.00	\$ 6,838.00	\$ 7,083.65	No Bid	\$ 7,625.05	\$ 7,525.00	No Bid
14.	SonicWALL Network Security E5500 Appliance Secure Upgrade Plus 2 Year (01-SSC-8678)	\$ 10,120.00	\$ 10,119.00	\$ 10,481.94	\$ 11,754.39	\$ 11,283.09	\$ 11,895.00	No Bid
<b>SonicWALL TZ UTM Firewall Appliance</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
15.	SonicWALL TZ 200 UTM Firewall Appliance(01-SSC-8741)	\$ 339.00	\$ 334.00	\$ 350.81	\$ 367.62	\$ 377.63	\$ 375.00	No Bid
16.	SonicWALL TZ 200 UTM Firewall Appliance Wireless-N(01-SSC-8742)	\$ 408.00	\$ 406.00	\$ 421.69	\$ 445.43	\$ 453.92	\$ 449.00	No Bid
17.	SonicWALL Software and Firmware Updates for TZ200 (1 Year) (01-SSC-8594)	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 56.70	\$ 71.09	\$ 61.03	\$ 59.50	No Bid
18.	SonicWALL TZ 210 UTM Firewall Appliance(01-SSC-8753)	\$ 545.00	\$ 544.00	\$ 563.44	\$ 590.33	\$ 606.49	\$ 599.00	No Bid
19.	SonicWALL TZ 210 UTM Firewall Appliance Wireless-N(01-SSC-8754)	\$ 681.00	\$ 681.00	\$ 705.18	\$ 791.66	\$ 759.07	\$ 749.00	No Bid
20.	SonicWALL Software and Firmware Updates for TZ210 (1 Year) (01-SSC-8616)	\$ 76.00	\$ 76.00	\$ 77.96	\$ 96.77	\$ 83.92	\$ 85.00	No Bid
<b>SonicWALL Comprehensive Gateway Security Licensing</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
21.	SonicWALL Comprehensive Gateway Security Suite for E5500 (1 Year) (01-SSC-9222)	\$ 3,281.00	\$ 3,281.00	\$ 3,398.30	\$ 4,650.18	\$ 3,658.04	\$ 3,575.00	No Bid

11-120 Network Equipment		ISG Technology	AMDEX	World Wide Technology	CDW Government	Ace Computers	Office Essentials	CDS Office Tech
22.	SonicWALL Comprehensive Gateway Security Suite for E5500 (2 Years) (01-SSC-9229)	\$ 5,471.00	\$ 5,470.00	\$ 5,666.20	\$ 6,321.16	\$ 6,099.28	\$ 5,950.00	No Bid
23.	SonicWALL Comprehensive Gateway Security Suite for E5500 (3 Years) (01-SSC-9236)	\$ 7,523.00	\$ 7,523.00	\$ 7,792.37	No Bid	\$ 8,387.94	\$ 9,015.00	No Bid

11-120 Network Equipment		ISG	AMDEX	World Wide	CDW	Ace	Office	CDS Office
		Technology		Technology	Government	Computers	Essentials	Tech
<b>SonicWALL SonicPoint Access Points</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
24.	SonicPoint-N Dual-Band without PoE Injector (4-Pack)(01-SSC-8568)	\$ 1,287.00	\$ 1,286.00	N/A	No Bid	\$ 1,434.23	N/A	No Bid
25.	SonicPoint-N Dual-Band without PoE Injector (8-Pack)(01-SSC-8569)	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 2,600.00	N/A	\$ 3,228.90	\$ 2,898.97	N/A	No Bid
26.	SonicPoint-Ne Dual-Band without PoE Injector (4-Pack)(01-SSC-8590)	\$ 1,249.00	\$ 1,248.00	\$ 1,293.41	\$ 1,535.66	\$ 1,392.27	\$ 1,375.00	No Bid
27.	SonicPoint-Ne Dual-Band without PoE Injector (8-Pack)(01-SSC-8579)	\$ 2,436.00	\$ 2,436.00	\$ 2,523.04	\$ 2,995.48	\$ 2,715.88	\$ 2,675.00	No Bid
28.	SonicPoint-Ni Dual-Band without PoE Injector (4-Pack)(01-SSC-8588)	\$ 852.00	\$ 852.00	\$ 882.36	\$ 1,048.42	\$ 949.79	\$ 935.00	No Bid
29.	SonicPoint-Ni Dual-Band without PoE Injector (8-Pack)(01-SSC-8592)	\$ 1,673.00	\$ 1,673.00	\$ 1,732.81	\$ 2,074.47	\$ 1,865.26	\$ 1,839.00	No Bid
30.	SonicWALL Dynamic Support 8x5 for Stand-Alone SonicPoints – 1 Year (01-SSC-6284)	\$ 61.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 63.07	\$ 79.34	\$ 67.90	\$ 66.50	No Bid
<b>PowerDsine PoE Midspans</b>								
<b>PowerDsine 3500G Family</b>								
	<b>Options</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>	<b>Price</b>
1.	PowerDsine 3506G 6-port, 100W Total PowerPD-3506G/AC	\$ 360.00	\$ 376.00	\$ 375.55	\$ 415.27	\$ 350.13	\$ 374.00	No Bid
2.	PowerDsine 3512G 12-port, 200W Total PowerPD-3512G/AC	\$ 573.00	\$ 607.00	\$ 601.34	\$ 664.25	\$ 560.64	\$ 585.00	No Bid
3.	PowerDsine 3524G 24-port, 200W Total PowerPD-3524G/AC	\$ 788.00	\$ 836.00	\$ 827.12	\$ 913.22	\$ 771.14	\$ 805.00	No Bid
4.	PowerDsine 3524G 6-port, 400W Total PowerPD-3524G/AC/F	\$ 860.00	\$ 910.00	\$ 902.38	\$ 996.87	\$ 841.31	\$ 898.00	No Bid