

11-054

Mosquito Control Chemicals

	ADAPCO, Inc			AllPro Vector Group			Clarke Mosquito Control			Univar USA			Gil Manufacturing		
	Product	UOM	Price/UOM	Product	UOM	Price/UOM	Product	UOM	Price/UOM	Product	UOM	Price/UOM	Product	UOM	Price/UOM
Organophosphate Adult Mosquito Control Insecticide	Fyfanon	Gallon	\$ 40.60			No Bid	Mosquitomist One	Gallon	\$ 39.00	Pyrofos1.5	Gallon	\$ 60.03	Pyrofos One Mist ULV EC	Gallon	\$ 51.66
Granular Larval Control Insecticide	Aquabac 200G	Pound	\$ 1.79			No Bid	VectoBac G	Pound	\$ 1.71	Teknar G	Pound	\$ 2.97			No Bid
Liquid Larval Control Agent	Aqnique MMF	Gallon	\$ 35.79			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid
Pyrethroid Adult Mosquito Control Insecticide	Perm-X UL 4-4	Gallon	\$ 27.95	Evolver 4-4	Gallon	\$ 24.00	Biomist 4+4	Gallon	\$ 37.00	Kontrol 4-4	Gallon	\$ 43.00	Omego Mist OSC	Gallon	\$ 44.41
Methoprene-based 30 day sustained release briquettes	Altosid 30 Day Briquets	Case	\$ 412.00			No Bid	Altosid 30 Day Briquets	Case	\$ 412.00	Altosid 30 Day Briquets	Case	\$ 412.00			No Bid