

11-050

Work Clothing

	Aramark	Gateway Uniform	Phoenix Textile
Item	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
Denim Jeans Relax fit	\$ 22.49	\$ 18.25	\$ 13.68
Denim Jeans Carpenter style	\$ 26.24	\$ 20.50	\$ 17.75
Denim Jean Shorts	No bid	\$ 15.00	\$ 14.25
Pocket T-Shirts	No bid	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.10
Pocket T-Shirts (Parks) S/S Green	\$ 6.74	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.10
Pocket T-Shirts (Parks) L/S Green	No bid	\$ 10.00	\$ 9.25
Denim Shirts Short Sleeve*	\$ 17.99	\$ 15.00	\$ 20.56
Denim Shirts Long Sleeve*	\$ 18.99	\$ 16.00	\$ 23.37
Denim Shirts Long Sleeve Tall*	\$ 18.99	\$ 21.00	\$ 25.50
Twill Shirts Short Sleeve*	\$ 18.99	\$ 19.00	\$ 26.12
Twill Shirts Long Sleeve*	\$ 19.99	\$ 20.50	\$ 26.75
Twill Shirts Long Sleeve Tall*	\$ 19.99	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00
Polo Shirts With Pockets*	\$ 22.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 16.60
Polo Shirts Without Pockets*	\$ 22.00	\$ 11.50	\$ 13.57
Polo Shirts (Parks)*	\$ 26.00	\$ 22.50	\$ 17.98
Jacket*	\$ 52.49	\$ 33.00	\$ 39.25
Jacket Tall*	No bid	No bid	\$ 41.75
Safety Jacket*	\$ 80.99	\$ 57.00	\$ 58.62
Safety Jacket Tall*	\$ 80.99	No bid	\$ 61.12
Jacket (Parks)*	\$ 52.49	\$ 32.00	\$ 37.68
Jacket (Parks) Tall*	\$ 52.49	No bid	\$ 40.18
Windshirts*	No bid	\$ 20.00	\$ 33.31
Windshirts Tall*	No bid	No bid	\$ 33.31
Windshirts (Parks)*	No bid	\$ 20.00	\$ 31.43
Windshirts (Parks) Tall*	No bid	No bid	\$ 33.31
Sweatshirts*	\$ 44.99	\$ 32.00	\$ 28.06
Sweatshirts (Parks)*	\$ 35.99	\$ 13.00	\$ 23.46
Coat*	\$ 63.74	\$ 59.00	\$ 67.06
Hood	No bid	\$ 16.00	\$ 20.25
Bib Overalls	\$ 67.49	\$ 79.00	\$ 51.18
Coveralls	\$ 74.99	\$ 85.00	\$ 47.95
Baseball caps*	\$ 10.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 10.75
Safety Vests	No bid	\$ 9.50	\$ 12.75