

11-040

Environmental Waste Disposal

	Heritage Crystal Clean	Tradebe Treatment & Recycling	Monarch Logistics	Inter-Rail Systems
Bridge Paint, Solvent, and Abrasive Waste Disposal				
Price per 55 gal barrel: Paint (w or w/o thinner)	\$ 145.00	\$ 93.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 225.00
Solvent	\$ 145.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 225.00
Abrasive	\$ 360.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 275.00
Price per pickup (once every 90 days) (in addition to the per barrel price):	N/A	\$ 250.00	\$650/load	\$ 200.00
Analyzation cost:	\$ 63.00	No Charge	\$1,195/test	N/A
Other costs (list):				
Transportation cost			\$375/load	
Oil & Water separator sludge analysis				\$ 695.00
Oil Filter Pickup per 55 gal barrel:	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 350.00
Oil Absorbent Pickup per 55 gal barrel:	\$ 205.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 350.00
Waste Oil Pickup for recycling per 250 gallon:	\$0.35*	\$ 150.00	No Charge	\$ 25.00
Oily Paper Rag Pickup per 55 gal Barrel:	\$ 360.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 350.00
Antifreeze recycling per gallon:	N/A	\$ 1.81	\$ 0.50	\$ 2.75
Parts Washer Service per visit (based on 2 per year)	\$174.00**	No bid	\$ 295.00	\$ 400.00
Pumping and disposal of sludge from Oil/Water separator per gallon:				
10% solids:	\$ 0.85	No bid	\$ 1.05	\$ 2.00
20% solids:	\$ 2.75	No bid	\$ 1.15	\$ 2.50
30% solids:	\$ 2.75	No bid	\$ 1.25	\$ 3.00

*payment per gallon

**per pickup only offers 4 per year

This is a list of the bid responses received, and is provided for informational purposes only. This is not a Notice of Bid Award.