

	Hall Sign, Inc		IBIS Signs		Interstate Highway Sign Co		Rocal, Inc		US Standard Sign		Custom Products Corp		Safeway Sign Company		Osburn Associates Inc	
	No Finish	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	No Finish	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	No Finish	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	No Finish	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	No Finish	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	No Finish	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	No Finish	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	No Finish	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting
Extruded Aluminum Street Sign Blanks																
9" X 24"	\$ 7.93	\$ 13.86	\$ 4.48	\$ 7.62	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.75	No bid	\$ 6.01	\$ 14.00	\$ 7.74	\$ 11.11	\$ 5.70	\$ 10.50
9" X 30"	\$ 9.75	\$ 17.17	\$ 5.60	\$ 9.53	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.19	No bid	\$ 7.53	\$ 17.50	\$ 9.38	\$ 13.26	\$ 7.13	\$ 13.13
9" X 36"	\$ 11.55	\$ 20.45	\$ 6.71	\$ 11.42	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 8.64	No bid	\$ 9.03	\$ 21.00	\$ 11.03	\$ 15.42	\$ 8.55	\$ 15.75
9" X 42"	\$ 13.37	\$ 23.75	\$ 7.84	\$ 13.34	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 10.31	No bid	\$ 10.56	\$ 24.50	\$ 12.67	\$ 17.57	\$ 9.96	\$ 18.34
9" X 48"	\$ 15.16	\$ 27.03	\$ 8.96	\$ 15.24	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 11.50	No bid	\$ 11.91	\$ 28.00	\$ 14.32	\$ 19.72	\$ 11.40	\$ 21.00
9" X 54"	\$ 16.98	\$ 30.33	\$ 10.07	\$ 17.14	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 12.94	No bid	\$ 13.40	\$ 31.50	\$ 15.97	\$ 21.87	\$ 12.81	\$ 23.59
9" X 60"	\$ 18.78	\$ 33.61	\$ 11.19	\$ 19.04	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 14.39	No bid	\$ 14.87	\$ 35.00	\$ 27.61	\$ 34.03	\$ 14.26	\$ 26.26
Aluminum Street Sign Blanks																
9" X 24"	\$ 3.91	\$ 7.04	\$ 4.26	\$ 7.40	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.49	No bid	\$ 3.46	\$ 5.78	\$ 4.81	\$ 6.84	\$ 3.38	\$ 8.18
9" X 30"	\$ 4.82	\$ 8.74	\$ 5.33	\$ 9.26	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 4.37	No bid	\$ 4.33	\$ 7.25	\$ 5.73	\$ 8.26	\$ 4.22	\$ 10.22
9" X 36"	\$ 5.74	\$ 10.44	\$ 6.40	\$ 11.11	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.02	No bid	\$ 5.13	\$ 8.65	\$ 6.64	\$ 9.68	\$ 5.06	\$ 12.26
9" X 42"	\$ 6.65	\$ 12.13	\$ 7.46	\$ 12.96	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 6.01	No bid	\$ 5.99	\$ 10.11	\$ 7.56	\$ 11.10	\$ 5.90	\$ 14.28
9" X 48"	\$ 7.57	\$ 13.84	\$ 8.53	\$ 14.81	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 6.70	No bid	\$ 6.62	\$ 11.10	\$ 8.52	\$ 12.57	\$ 6.75	\$ 16.35
9" X 54"	\$ 8.48	\$ 15.53	\$ 9.59	\$ 16.66	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.54	No bid	\$ 7.45	\$ 12.49	\$ 9.59	\$ 14.14	\$ 7.58	\$ 18.33
9" X 60"	\$ 9.39	\$ 17.23	\$ 10.66	\$ 18.51	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 8.38	No bid	\$ 8.25	\$ 13.86	\$ 10.65	\$ 15.71	\$ 8.44	\$ 20.44
Aluminum Sign Blanks (Specify Thickness)	0.080		0.080		No bid			0.080		0.080		0.080		0.080		0.080
	Price		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price	
24" Octagon	\$ 8.69		\$ 11.38		No bid		\$ 10.03		\$ 8.57		\$ 7.80		\$ 11.36		\$ 9.00	
30" Octagon	\$ 13.53		\$ 17.77		No bid		\$ 14.84		\$ 13.40		\$ 12.31		\$ 17.75		\$ 14.00	
36" Octagon	\$ 19.24		\$ 25.60		No bid		\$ 21.90		\$ 19.30		\$ 17.77		\$ 25.56		\$ 20.50	
12" Octagon	\$ 3.16		\$ 2.82		No bid		\$ 2.42		\$ 2.15		\$ 3.45		\$ 3.59		\$ 2.35	
30" Triangular	\$ 7.48		\$ 9.82		No bid		\$ 7.23		\$ 9.93		\$ 7.29		\$ 7.95		\$ 7.50	
36" Triangular	\$ 10.63		\$ 14.11		No bid		\$ 9.76		\$ 13.95		\$ 10.45		\$ 11.08		\$ 11.75	
30" Circle	\$ 16.90		\$ 17.77		No bid		\$ 15.34		\$ 14.97		\$ 12.31		\$ 17.75		\$ 14.69	
36" Circle	\$ 25.45		\$ 25.60		No bid		\$ 23.07		\$ 21.11		\$ 17.77		\$ 25.56		\$ 21.15	
30" Pentagon	\$ 13.52		\$ 17.77		No bid		\$ 15.34		\$ 14.22		\$ 12.31		\$ 17.75		\$ 14.19	
36" Pentagon	\$ 19.74		\$ 25.60		No bid		\$ 22.40		\$ 20.00		\$ 17.77		\$ 25.56		\$ 21.15	
12" X 12"	\$ 2.53		\$ 2.82		No bid		\$ 2.42		\$ 2.46		\$ 2.45		\$ 3.59		\$ 2.35	
12" X 18"	\$ 3.69		\$ 4.22		No bid		\$ 3.64		\$ 3.49		\$ 3.39		\$ 4.81		\$ 3.53	
18" X 18"	\$ 5.54		\$ 6.40		No bid		\$ 5.45		\$ 5.02		\$ 5.02		\$ 6.64		\$ 5.29	
18" X 24"	\$ 7.28		\$ 8.53		No bid		\$ 7.12		\$ 6.70		\$ 6.47		\$ 8.52		\$ 7.05	
24" X 12"	\$ 4.85		\$ 5.69		No bid		\$ 4.61		\$ 4.46		\$ 4.48		\$ 6.03		\$ 4.70	
24" X 24"	\$ 9.64		\$ 11.38		No bid		\$ 10.03		\$ 8.94		\$ 8.69		\$ 11.36		\$ 9.40	
24" X 30"	\$ 11.95		\$ 14.22		No bid		\$ 11.87		\$ 11.18		\$ 10.78		\$ 14.20		\$ 11.75	
24" X 36"	\$ 14.26		\$ 17.07		No bid		\$ 14.25		\$ 13.40		\$ 12.90		\$ 17.04		\$ 14.10	
30" X 30"	\$ 15.01		\$ 17.77		No bid		\$ 14.84		\$ 13.96		\$ 13.48		\$ 17.75		\$ 14.69	
36" X 36"	\$ 21.38		\$ 25.60		No bid		\$ 21.90		\$ 20.12		\$ 19.42		\$ 25.56		\$ 21.15	
48" X 24"	\$ 19.34		\$ 22.75		No bid		\$ 20.06		\$ 17.88		\$ 17.26		\$ 22.72		\$ 18.80	
48" X 30"	\$ 23.96		\$ 28.16		No bid		\$ 24.33		\$ 22.34		\$ 21.47		\$ 28.40		\$ 23.50	
Finished Signs W/ High Intensity Prismatic Reflective Sheeting (Must Meet ASTM D 4956 Type III & IV)																
	Price		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price	
24" Octagon	\$ 17.44		\$ 19.76		\$ 27.03		No bid		No bid		\$ 15.00		\$ 16.76		\$ 16.00	
30" Octagon	\$ 26.78		\$ 30.86		\$ 42.23		No bid		No bid		\$ 22.87		\$ 26.19		\$ 25.00	
36" Octagon	\$ 38.23		\$ 44.45		\$ 60.83		No bid		No bid		\$ 32.00		\$ 37.71		\$ 38.25	
36" Circle	\$ 44.04		\$ 44.45		\$ 60.83		No bid		No bid		\$ 32.99		\$ 37.71		\$ 38.25	
30" Triangular	\$ 14.99		\$ 16.67		\$ 42.23		No bid		No bid		\$ 12.47		\$ 11.73		\$ 14.00	
36" Triangular	\$ 21.51		\$ 23.61		\$ 60.83		No bid		No bid		\$ 15.85		\$ 16.34		\$ 22.00	
10" X 30"	\$ 9.75		\$ 10.29		\$ 14.08		No bid		No bid		\$ 8.84		\$ 9.05		\$ 8.25	
12" X 12"	\$ 5.01		\$ 4.91		\$ 6.76		No bid		No bid		\$ 5.14		\$ 4.94		\$ 4.20	
12" X 18"	\$ 7.14		\$ 7.36		\$ 10.14		No bid		No bid		\$ 6.29		\$ 6.84		\$ 6.38	
18" X 6"	\$ 3.79		\$ 3.70		\$ 5.07		No bid		No bid		\$ 4.00		\$ 3.99		\$ 3.19	
18" X 18"	\$ 10.53		\$ 11.11		\$ 15.20		No bid		No bid		\$ 9.57		\$ 9.68		\$ 9.56	
18" X 24"	\$ 13.74		\$ 14.81		\$ 20.27		No bid		No bid		\$ 11.89		\$ 12.57		\$ 12.75	
24" X 8"	\$ 6.37		\$ 6.59		\$ 9.01		No bid		No bid		\$ 5.59		\$ 6.20		\$ 5.67	
24" X 10"	\$ 7.91		\$ 8.23		\$ 11.26		No bid		No bid		\$ 6.98		\$ 7.47		\$ 7.85	
24" X 12"	\$ 9.36		\$ 9.88		\$ 13.52		No bid		No bid		\$ 8.49		\$ 8.38		\$ 8.50	
24" X 24"	\$ 18.07		\$ 19.76		\$ 27.02		No bid		No bid		\$ 15.83		\$ 16.76		\$ 17.00	
24" X 30"	\$ 22.41		\$ 24.69		\$ 33.79		No bid		No bid		\$ 19.72		\$ 20.95		\$ 21.25	
24" X 48"	\$ 36.12		\$ 39.50		\$ 54.06		No bid		No bid		\$ 30.66		\$ 33.52		\$ 39.00	
30" X 30"	\$ 27.91		\$ 30.86		\$ 23.73		No bid		No bid		\$ 23.95		\$ 26.19		\$ 26.56	
36" X 12"	\$ 13.65		\$ 14.81		\$ 11.39		No bid		No bid		\$ 11.89		\$ 12.57		\$ 12.75	
36" X 24"	\$ 26.75		\$ 29.63		\$ 22.78		No bid		No bid		\$ 22.93		\$ 25.14		\$ 25.50	
36" X 36"	\$ 39.89		\$ 44.45		\$ 34.18		\$ 41.07		No bid		\$ 34.13		\$ 37.71		\$ 38.25	
48" X 30"	\$ 45.41		\$ 49.10		\$ 37.97		\$ 45.63		No bid		\$ 37.92		\$ 41.90		\$ 42.50	
10" X 30" Double Face (Hazard Markers)	\$ 15.25		\$ 14.65		\$ 21.22		\$ 11.80		No bid		\$ 13.26		\$ 11.86		\$ 12.50	
18" X 18" End of Road Markers	\$ 10.53		\$ 15.82		\$ 8.54		\$ 10.39		No bid		\$ 9.20		\$ 9.43		\$ 10.63	
	Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting		Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting		Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting		Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting		Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting		Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting		Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting		Covered W/ High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	
30" Stop Sign Faces W/ High Intensity Prismatic	\$ 11.12		\$ 13.09		No bid		\$ 11.60		No bid		\$ 11.01		\$ 13.38		\$ 10.00	
100 Sign "Date" Stickers (See Specifications)	\$ 67.00		\$ 24.00		No bid		\$ 2.21		No bid		\$ 30.00		\$ 2.89		\$ 95.00	
500 Sign "Date" Stickers (See Specifications)	\$ 150.00		\$ 120.00		No bid		\$ 3.53		No bid		\$ 140.00		\$ 2.89		\$ 200.00	