

11-034
Sign Sheeting

	3M		Interstate Highway Sign Co		American Traffic Safety Materials Inc		Custom Products Corp.		Osburn Associates, Inc		Safeway Sign Company		Traffic Safety Warehouse	
	Hi-Intensity	Eng Grade	Hi-Intensity	Eng Grade	Hi-Intensity	Eng Grade	Hi-Intensity	Eng Grade	Hi-Intensity	Eng Grade	Hi-Intensity	Eng Grade	Hi-Intensity	Eng Grade
Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting & Eng Grade														
6" X 50 Yards	\$ 123.75	\$ 63.75	\$ 139.39	\$ 91.35	No bid	\$ 76.50	\$ 114.00	\$ 56.25	\$ 95.20	\$ 50.00	\$ 114.10	\$ 53.46	\$ 175.00	\$ 102.00
7" X 50 Yards	\$ 144.38	\$ 74.38	\$ 157.37	\$ 101.32	No bid	\$ 95.63	\$ 133.76	\$ 66.00	\$ 111.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 133.12	\$ 62.37	\$ 205.00	\$ 118.00
24" X 50 Yards	\$ 495.00	\$ 255.00	\$ 471.55	\$ 270.90	No bid	\$ 306.00	\$ 456.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 198.00	\$ 456.38	\$ 213.83	\$ 700.00	\$ 405.00
30" X 50 Yards	\$ 618.75	\$ 318.75	\$ 586.69	\$ 330.75	No bid	\$ 382.50	\$ 570.00	\$ 281.25	\$ 476.00	\$ 247.00	\$ 597.86	\$ 267.29	\$ 875.00	\$ 505.00
36" X 50 Yards	\$ 742.50	\$ 382.50	\$ 694.58	\$ 406.35	No bid	\$ 459.00	\$ 684.00	\$ 337.50	\$ 571.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 684.57	\$ 320.74	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 610.00
3/4" X 50 Yards - Border Black (Vinyl)	\$	7.49	\$	26.10	\$	8.68	\$	10.12	\$	25.00	\$	8.51	\$	17.00
12" X 50 Yards Barricade Tape (Engineer Grade)	\$	127.50	\$	149.70	\$	129.00	\$	172.31	\$	135.00	\$	151.60	\$	260.00
30" X 50 Yards Transfer Tape	\$	270.00	\$	207.14	\$	93.00	\$	71.77	\$	90.00	\$	287.23	\$	100.00
30" X 50 Yards Black Vinyl Sheeting	\$	299.48	\$	330.75	\$	179.63	\$	376.28	\$	261.00	\$	340.26	\$	155.00

This is a list of the bid responses received, and is provided for informational purposes only. This is not a Notice of Bid Award.