

11-033

Sign Posts and Barricades

Brackets For Extruded Street Signs	American Sign Brackets		Custom Products Corp.		J & A Traffic Products		Schulte Supply		Hall Signs Inc	
	4"	12"	4"	12"	4"	12"	4"	12"	4"	12"
Round To Blade	\$ 6.05	\$ 13.10	\$ 3.52	\$ 9.55	\$ 4.40	\$ 13.50	\$ 5.50	\$ 14.70	\$ 3.87	\$ 9.95
Channel To Blade	\$ 4.81	\$ 13.10	\$ 3.35	\$ 9.55	\$ 4.40	\$ 13.50	\$ 4.20	\$ 14.70	\$ 3.45	\$ 9.95
Blade To Blade	\$ 4.70	\$ 13.10	\$ 3.35	\$ 9.55	\$ 4.40	\$ 13.50	\$ 5.20	\$ 14.70	\$ 3.33	\$ 9.95
	<b>Post &gt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &lt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &gt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &lt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &gt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &lt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &gt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &lt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &gt; 4"</b>	<b>Post &lt; 4"</b>
<b>Stainless Steel Brackets for Strapping to Round Post</b>	No Bid	No bid	\$ 7.47	\$ 7.47	\$ 0.95	\$ 0.95	\$ 8.70	\$ 21.60	\$ 6.33	No bid
<b>Galvanized "Perforated Square" Posts</b>	<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>		<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>		<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>		<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>		<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>	
8 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	No Bid		\$ 829.00		\$ 752.00		\$ 1,399.50		No Bid	
10 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	No Bid		\$ 1,036.50		\$ 940.00		\$ 1,749.50		No Bid	
12 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	No Bid		\$ 1,243.50		\$ 1,105.00		\$ 2,099.50		No Bid	
3 Ft By 2.25 In by 2.25 In, 12 Gauge	No Bid		\$ 467.50		\$ 410.00		\$ 755.00		No Bid	
<b>Galvanized U-Channel Posts</b>	<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>		<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>		<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>		<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>		<b>Price Each Per Bundle of 50</b>	
8 Ft by 2 Lb per Ft Galvanized U-Channel Post	No Bid		\$ 643.50		\$ 785.00		\$ 1,110.00		\$ 708.00	
12 Ft by 2 Lb per Ft Galvanized U-Channel Post	No Bid		\$ 965.00		\$ 1,177.50		\$ 1,664.50		\$ 1,038.00	
<b>Traffic Delineators</b>	<b>Price per each</b>		<b>Price per each</b>		<b>Price per each</b>		<b>Price per each</b>		<b>Price per each</b>	
36" Barricades	No Bid		\$ 34.57		\$ 41.20		\$ 48.03		No Bid	
36" Barricades With Flashers And Battery	No Bid		\$ 55.60		\$ 63.92		\$ 69.12		No Bid	
Batteries For Barricades	No Bid		\$ 3.02		\$ 1.68		\$ 2.29		No Bid	
12" Cones	No Bid		\$ 4.20		\$ 4.50		\$ 3.39		No Bid	
18" Cones	No Bid		\$ 4.34		\$ 5.75		\$ 4.89		No Bid	
28" Cones	No Bid		\$ 7.19		\$ 10.55		\$ 8.69		No Bid	
Trim-Line Channelizers with 15 Lb Base	No Bid		\$ 31.70		\$ 33.15		\$ 33.89		No Bid	

*This is a list of the bid responses received, and is provided for informational purposes only. This is not a Notice of Bid Award.*