

11-032

Sand Aggregate Crushed Stone

Item	UOM	Central Stone Company	Big Creek Quarry	APAC Missouri	Schiermeier Quarry	LaFarge Na	Old Monroe Sand & Gravel	Fred Weber
Riprap	per ton	\$ 15.00	No bid	\$ 15.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 9.00	No bid	No bid
Shot Rock	per ton	\$ 5.05	\$ 4.05	\$ 6.75	\$ 4.50	\$ 6.00	No bid	No bid
Quarry Run	per ton	\$ 6.05	No bid	No bid	\$ 4.50	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.50
Screenings	per ton	\$ 3.90	\$ 1.75	\$ 3.25	\$ 2.00	\$ 1.75	No bid	\$ 1.50
Pug Mill	per ton	\$ 6.20	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.25	No bid	No bid	\$ 5.75
Type 1 Aggregate Base	per ton	\$ 5.50	\$ 4.20	No bid	\$ 5.50	\$ 5.50	No bid	\$ 5.75
Type 5 Aggregate Base	per ton	\$ 5.90	\$ 4.20	\$ 6.50	\$ 5.50	\$ 5.50	No bid	\$ 5.75
Clay Fill	per ton	No bid	\$ 1.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Sand	per ton	\$ 6.65	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.25	\$ 6.25	No bid
Minus Rock								
5/16"	per ton	\$ 3.90	No bid	No bid	\$ 2.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 1.50
3/8"	per ton	\$ 5.25	No bid	No bid	\$ 3.50	No bid	No bid	No bid
1"	per ton	\$ 5.25	\$ 3.85	\$ 5.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.25	No bid	\$ 4.15
1 1/2"	per ton	\$ 5.25	No bid	No bid	\$ 4.50	No bid	No bid	No bid
2"	per ton	\$ 5.25	\$ 4.00	\$ 5.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.25	No bid	\$ 4.50
3"	per ton	\$ 5.50	No bid	No bid	\$ 4.50	No bid	No bid	No bid
Clean Rock								
3/8"	per ton	\$ 10.80	No bid	\$ 11.25	\$ 7.50	No bid	No bid	\$ 11.00
1/2"	per ton	\$ 10.80	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.50	No bid	No bid	No bid
3/4"	per ton	\$ 10.10	No bid	\$ 9.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 9.00	No bid	No bid
1"	per ton	\$ 10.10	\$ 7.75	\$ 9.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.40	No bid	\$ 10.25
1 1/2"	per ton	\$ 10.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 9.25	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.00	No bid	No bid
2"	per ton	\$ 9.05	\$ 5.75	\$ 8.25	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.80	No bid	\$ 7.95
3"	per ton	\$ 9.35	No bid	No bid	\$ 7.75	No bid	No bid	No bid
4"-6"	per ton	No bid	No bid	\$ 9.75	\$ 8.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Gabion	per ton	\$ 10.90	\$ 9.00	No bid	\$ 10.50	\$ 9.00	No bid	\$ 11.00