

11-026

Asphaltic Concrete

Description	Fred Weber		N B West Contracting		Pace Construction		Missouri Petroleum	
Bidder wishes to be bound by the Asphalt Cement Price Index as described in the bid specifications:	√				√			
Bidder does not wish to be bound by the Asphalt Cement Price Index as described in the bid specifications:			√				√	
	Price per Ton (FOB plant)		Price per Ton (FOB plant)		Price per Ton (FOB plant)		Price per Ton (FOB plant)	
Type BP-1 Mix (County Spec Section 401.3)	\$ 44.00		No Bid		\$ 45.50		No Bid	
Type BP-2 Mix (County Spec Section 401.3)	\$ 44.00		No Bid		\$ 45.50		No Bid	
Type Bit Base Mix (County Spec Section 405.3)	\$ 44.00		No Bid		\$ 45.50		No Bid	
PG 64-22	\$ 44.00		No Bid		\$ 45.50		No Bid	
PG 70-22	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 54.50		No Bid	
PG 76-22	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 56.50		No Bid	
Cold Mix (per ton)	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
UPM High Performance Cold Mix or equivalent (per ton)	\$ 97.50		\$ 100.00		No Bid		\$ 97.00	
400 Ton or More - Bulk (per ton)	\$ 97.50		\$ 100.00		No Bid		\$ 97.00	
ZONE	BIT BASE	BP-1	BIT BASE	BP-1	BIT BASE	BP-1	BIT BASE	BP-1
1	\$ 51.75	\$ 51.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.30	\$ 50.30	No Bid	No Bid
1A	\$ 51.75	\$ 51.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.20	\$ 50.20	No Bid	No Bid
2	\$ 51.75	\$ 51.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.10	\$ 51.10	No Bid	No Bid
2A	\$ 51.75	\$ 51.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.90	\$ 49.90	No Bid	No Bid
3	\$ 51.50	\$ 51.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.40	\$ 51.40	No Bid	No Bid
3A	\$ 51.50	\$ 51.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.10	\$ 50.10	No Bid	No Bid
4	\$ 51.85	\$ 51.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.70	\$ 51.70	No Bid	No Bid
4A	\$ 51.85	\$ 51.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.20	\$ 51.20	No Bid	No Bid
5	\$ 52.10	\$ 52.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.10	\$ 52.10	No Bid	No Bid
5A	\$ 52.10	\$ 52.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.90	\$ 50.90	No Bid	No Bid
6	\$ 52.40	\$ 52.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.50	\$ 52.50	No Bid	No Bid
6A	\$ 52.40	\$ 52.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.70	\$ 50.70	No Bid	No Bid
7	\$ 52.75	\$ 52.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.60	\$ 52.60	No Bid	No Bid
7A	\$ 52.75	\$ 52.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.10	\$ 50.10	No Bid	No Bid
8	\$ 53.30	\$ 53.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.70	\$ 52.70	No Bid	No Bid
8A	\$ 53.30	\$ 53.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.80	\$ 49.80	No Bid	No Bid
9	\$ 53.40	\$ 53.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.70	\$ 52.70	No Bid	No Bid
9A	\$ 53.40	\$ 53.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.10	\$ 50.10	No Bid	No Bid